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If ever there was an ideal union between golf and hospitality, Fairmont Hotels & Resorts would be the happy honeymooners. The
Resort giant, which also has numerous golf-equipped properties, just unveiled a remarkable list of golf vacation packages to suit any
player’s destination desires and par pocketbooks.  

 

Eastern Canada 

 The Fairmont Algonquin (pictured above) located in New Brunswick, blends Old-World charm with modern luxury and is Canada’s historic
seaside resort. This elegant Tudor-style “Castle-by-the-Sea” overlooks historic Passamaquoddy Bay and has delivered warm, authentic
Maritime hospitality since 1889. Algonquin Golf Course and Academy is home to two of the top ten golf courses in Canada which borders the
rugged shoreline of the Bay of Fundy. The Stay for Free Package, available through Oct. 31, 2010; rates start at $199 CAD per night,
single/double occupancy. Call 866.540.4403 or visit www.fairmont.com/algonquin. Includes Luxury accommodation in a Fairmont Room and one
round of golf per person on the signature Algonquin Golf Course, based upon availability. 

 The stunning red cedar log Château Montebello in Quebec is famed for its rugged luxury, tranquil setting, excellent service and refined
cuisine. The beautiful surroundings offer exceptional year-round activities highlighted by the stunning Montebello Golf Club and a brand new
spa. The Ultimate Golf Package, available through Oct. 16, 2010; rates start at $450 CAD per night, based on double occupancy with a
two-night minimum stay required on certain dates. Call 866.540.4462 or visit www.fairmont.com/montebello. Includes Luxury accommodation in
a Fairmont Room, Buffet breakfast at Aux Chantignoles Restaurant, Two rounds of golf for two with golf cart (one round on the day of arrival
after 1 p.m. and the second the next day), 10% discount on selected merchandise in the golf shop and access to the Montebello Sports Center,
indoor and outdoor swimming pools and one hour of indoor or outdoor tennis or squas.  

Western Canada 

 The Fairmont Banff Springs – Known as “The Castle in the Rockies,” The Fairmont Banff Springs is located in the heart of Banff National
Park, a UNESCO World Heritage Site, and offers two exceptional golf courses (including its famed Stanley Thompson Course) as well as
world-class dining and an award-winning Willow Stream Spa. Golf FORE free is available throughout the 2010 golf season. Rates start from
$298 CAD per person, per night based on single/double occupancy in a Fairmont Room. For reservations or more information, please call
866.540.4406; or visit www.fairmont.com/banffsprings. The package includes Luxury accommodations, one complimentary round of golf per
person, per day (Golf is not available to children staying on this package.) Tee times are subject to availability. Subject to availability. Rates do
not include applicable taxes. 

  The Fairmont Jasper Park Lodge – Nestled between the Rockies and a stunning alpine lake, Jasper Park Lodge offers a setting like none
other. Its Stanley Thompson golf course is widely considered one of the most beautiful in the world. Charming cabins, luxurious resort
accommodations and thrilling outdoor recreation make Fairmont Jasper Park Lodge the perfect destination to experience the grandeur of
western Canada. Golf FORE free is available until Oct. 10, 2010. Rates start at $299 CAD per person, per night based on single/double
occupancy and a two-night minimum stay. For reservations or more information, please call 866.540.4454; or visit www.fairmont.com/jasper.
The package includes luxury accommodations, one complimentary round of golf per person, per day* after 11 a.m. (Golf is not available to
children staying on this package), Complimentary use of a golf cart, Complimentary use of the practice facility. Tee times are subject to
availability. Subject to availability. Rates do not include applicable taxes. 

  The Fairmont Chateau Whistler – Nestled at the base of Blackcomb Mountain (the mountain host of the 2010 Olympic Games), The Fairmont
Chateau Whistler defines mountain luxury. Its heralded Robert Trent Jones, Jr. designed golf course is a modern classic and it blends
effortlessly with the beautiful surroundings and the classic elegance of this landmark hotel. Summer Olympic-themed Packages, available
through Sept. 30, 2010; rates start at $330 CDN per room, per night/double occupancy for the Bronze Package (Gold and Silver Packages also
available). Call 800.606.8244 or visit www.fairmont.com/whistler. Summer Bronze Package includes: One night luxury accommodation in a
Fairmont room with a complimentary upgrade when available, A Bronze-themed chocolate welcome amenity, Breakfast daily and $100 CDN
activity credit per person (can be applied to Fairmont Chateau Whistler Golf Club, Whistler Outdoor Adventures, Vida Wellness Spa or Mountain
Adventure Centre. 

Hawaii 

 The Fairmont Orchid – Located on Hawaii’s “Big Island,” The Fairmont Orchid combines the sublime luxury and natural beauty of the Kohala
Coast with exceptional amenities, including an award-winning spa; outstanding dining and magnificent golf courtesy of the adjacent Francis H.
I’i Brown Golf Courses with 36-holes of championship caliber golf. Hawaii’s Summer Golf Package, available through Aug. 31, 2010; rates start
at $489 per night/double occupancy. Call 800.845.9905 or visit www.fairmont.com/orchid. Includes: Luxurious accommodations, daily round of
golf for two, complimentary club rental, complimentary use of practice facilities and a personalized golf bag tag 

  The Fairmont Kea Lani – This distinctive resort rests gracefully on the sands of Maui’s famed Polo Beach in Wailea and offers spacious
suites and villas in a lush 22-acre setting. Guests enjoy privileges at the award-winning Wailea Golf Club, one of the largest, most celebrated
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golf facilities in Hawaii. Easy to Book Golf Package, available until Dec. 17, 2010; rates start at $699 per night/double occupancy. Call
866.540.4456 or visit www.fairmont.com/kealani. Includes: Accommodations in a one-bedroom suite or spacious villa, Daily round of golf for two
at one of the three courses – Emerald, Gold or Old Blue (subject to availability), Complimentary transportation to and from Wailea Golf Club and
Deluxe buffet breakfast at Kea Lani Restaurant for two adult.  

Mexico 

 The Fairmont Acapulco Princess – Recognized as one of the top 500 hotels in the world and top 25 resorts in Latin America by Travel &
Leisure, The Fairmont Acapulco Princess reigns over 480 tropical acres on picturesque Revolcadero Beach. The unique Aztec pyramid-shaped
resort features lush gardens, sparkling pools, renowned golf course, fine dining restaurants, luxurious spa, and…most recently…Pearl, Acapulco's
newest luxury experience. Pearl is an exclusive luxury beach enclave offering exquisite accommodations and the finest services and amenities.
Golf for Two, available until Dec. 31, 2010; rates start at $501 USD per night, double/single occupancy. Call 800.441.1414 or visit 
www.fairmont.com/acapulco. Includes: One-night accommodation in Pearl, the newest most luxurious ocean-view rooms, One round of golf per
day per person (double or single occupancy) and Complimentary breakfast daily.  

Scotland 

 Fairmont St Andrews – This luxurious five-star cliff-top resort in the “Home of Golf,” overlooks the beautiful North Sea and the storybook
village of St Andrews. Its stunning Torrance Course will host the final qualifying tournament for the 2010 Open Championship. Summer Golf for
Two is available until Oct. 31, 2010; rates start at just from £319 per person and inclusive of 17.5% VAT, based on double occupancy. For
reservations or more information, please call 800.257.7544 or visit www.fairmont.com/standrews. Package includes Two nights’
accommodations in a newly remodeled guest room, Full Scottish breakfast in the Squire Restaurant andTwo rounds of golf per person on either
the Torrance Course or the Kittocks Course, each selected by Golfweek among the “Top Modern Golf Courses in Great Britain and Ireland.” 

 To Learn More  

 www.fairmontgolf.com. 

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

                        2 / 2

http://www.fairmont.com/kealani
http://www.fairmont.com/acapulco
http://www.fairmont.com/standrews
http://www.fairmontgolf.com
http://www.tcpdf.org

